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Rev. Robert Brucciani, District Superior

Ever faithful
Revisiting the heroic struggle
of Archbishop Lefebvre

My dear Faithful,

The Society of St. Pius X is a con-
troversial organisation because it
swims against the tide of modern-
ism – the heresy that is presently
taking much of the Church to its
ruin.

In its early years, the Society was
accused of breaking the law that
governs the Church. It was declared
officially suppressed; its founder
was put under a penalty of suspen-
sion and then later declared excom-
municated for consecrating four
bishops without a mandate. The law
of the Church, which has its finality
in the salvation of souls, was de-
ployed to the opposite effect. It was
used in support of a revolution in

which the religion of God was re-
placed by the religion of man.

Of course, a law used against the fi-
nality of the law has no weight of
authority. Hence, the founder of the
Society, Archbishop Marcel Lefeb-
vre, continued his work of training
priests to teach, govern, and sanc-
tify souls according to the tradi-
tions of the Catholic Church. In do-
ing so, he followed the highest
principle of law: the salvation of
souls.

For the faithful who lived through
the battles of the 1970s and 80s, the
story is engrained in their memory,
but for the succeeding generations
of faithful who may be unaware of
the drama of that time, this story
merits being told again.

Editorial
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The story also needs to be told to
the rest of the world, for as the re-
volution in the Church approaches
its logical terminus in spiritual
bankruptcy and chaos, the Society
will find itself in the spotlight once
more. It stands out as a sign of con-
tradiction to the revolutionaries
and can expect to be attacked again
with renewed vigour. It also stands
out as a beacon of hope for souls
yearning after truth, order, and
grace in the Church.

In this edition of Ite Missa Est, Rev.
Fr. François Laisney tells the story
of the Society in its early days in
the hope that a new generation of
faithful may understand how Arch-
bishop Lefebvre and his Society re-
mained ever-faithful.

Wishing you a holy Lent and a truly
happy Easter: full of grace and joy.

In Jesu et Maria,
Rev. Robert Brucciani

Seminarians

We are delighted to report that two
seminarians from the District re-
ceived the cassock on 2nd February:
Mr. Joseph Bradshaw of Newbury,
at St. Curé of Ars Seminary, Flav-
igny, France and Mr. Morten Bay,
of Struer, Denmark at Sacred Heart
Seminary, Zaitskofen, Germany.

Please keep them in your prayers.

St. Michael’s School admissions

Please apply to the headmaster for
a prospectus.
headmaster@sanctusmichael.com

Confirmations May-June 2023

Please register if you have not
already done so. Children need to
apply for a catechism course.
See this page for all details:
https://fsspx.uk/en/confirmations-
gb-ireland-may-june-2023

Camps

Both the boys camp (24th-29th July)
and girls camp (7th-12th Aug) are be-
ing organised. Volunteers are re-
quired. Please send an email to
either:
• boyscamp@fsspx.uk
• girlscamp@fsspx.uk

News
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Rev. Fr. François Laisney SSPX

In defence of
Archbishop
Lefebvre

Introduction

Until a few months ago, I was in
New Zealand, far from the front line
of ecclesiastical debate. But having
now come to my new assignment in
England, a confrere asked if I could
help some faithful troubled by
doubts about the Society’s canon-
ical status and its relation to the
Church. Therefore, I set down here
a few reflections, which I hope – by
the grace of God – may be of some
help to the faithful.

Attitudes towards the Society of
St. Pius X range from light disagree-
ment over methods, to enmity res-
ulting in calumny (accusing
someone of something grievous but
false) such as accusing Archbishop

Lefebvre of nothing less than
heresy! I will show how false such
an accusation is and hopefully con-
vince the reader of the Archbishop’s
supernatural prudence in the
troubled years following the Second
Vatican Council.

1. A little bit of history: the
Liturgical Revolution of the
1960s

For the faithful in the pew, the de-
vout faithful, the 1960s were a time
when everything started to change
and confusion reigned, especially in
the Liturgy: it was a true liturgical
revolution. First, a little vernacular,
then more here and more there,
then the removal of this or that
prayer (e.g. the last gospel), then

The Society’s early years
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communion standing, then altars
turned around, then in some places
communion in the hand, then…
then… then… The faithful did not
know what novelty to expect the
next Sunday – missals had been re-
placed by weekly sheets for years
A, B, C. Their old missals where are

worthless. The more devout faithful
bought new missals, but did not get
very far with them because every
parish was different… The new
Mass was just one reform among so
many others.

9

Archbishop Lefebvre as altar boy for Rev. Fr. François Laisney in Chicago 1985..
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My own experience was that the
faithful were much more shocked
by communion in the hand – which
was so repugnant to their faith and
devotion – than by the new Mass it-
self when it was reverently offered
(for they had no real way of study-
ing it as had priests such as Rev. Fr.
Calmel, O.P.: see his articles in
Itinéraires).

One phenomenon, a painful one for
all good faithful who love the
Church, was that the disobedient
priests, who were introducing all
kinds of novelties, as grievous as
communion in the hand, were sup-
ported “from above” and received
no censure, while the faithful
priests, who preached good doc-
trine, who did not allow commu-
nion in the hand in their parishes,
who would not have guitars at their
Masses but rather kept the
Gregorian Chant, these faithful
priests were removed from their po-
sitions, demoted and sometimes
even sent into early retirement. The
same thing still happens today:
Bishop Rey of Toulon in France, for
example, who had more vocations
in his diocese (proportionally to its
size) than any other diocese in
France, was asked by Rome in June
last year to postpone ordinations to
the priesthood to an unknown date.

In my own parish, Our Lady of the
Angels at Bihorel near Rouen, the
parish priest was made 2nd assist-
ant priest in another parish of the
city, and the assistant was sent to
the limits of the diocese: they were
both good priests, whose preaching
was orthodox, who had kept their
cassocks, who would not have
Communion in the hand, who kept
their Gregorian choir at a time
when there were no Novus Ordo
Gregorian books – they used to sing
the traditional texts despite these
texts not matching the readings!
From that local parish came five
traditional vocations (4 were or-
dained by Archbishop Lefebvre).

Their replacement was a “priest of
transition” who brought in all the
novelties from which these two
priests had protected the parish.
Then started the exodus: my family
left that parish and we looked for
conservative priests, until we found
the Traditional Mass again. My
mother said at the time: all the
changes in the previous years were
like the slow descent of a cliff face,
and when she found the Traditional
Mass again, it was like finding one-
self at the bottom of the cliff [there
are high cliffs on the north bank of
the river Seine near Rouen], looking
up, and realising how far one had
actually descended.

The Society’s early years
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Some faithful found the traditional
Mass early on: my family in 1975,
others even earlier, some later. But
for all of them, the finding of the
Traditional Mass was an eye-open-
ing experience: this is the treasure
of which we had been deprived!
Many today have the same reaction
when they discover the Traditional
Mass: even those born after 1970. It
is often a turning point in their
lives. The Traditional Mass is the
heart of the Church, it is the
greatest treasure of the Church, it is
the Catholic Faith put in practice in
all its solemnity and fruitfulness.

2. A little bit more history:
the beginnings of the SSPX

It is important to note that the con-
fusion was not merely in the do-
main of liturgy. More importantly, it
was in matters of faith. For the
clergy, the Council introduced an
openness to the world that often di-
luted the faith with ambiguities and
sometimes outright errors. It en-
couraged them to have a “sympathy
for the religion of man who made
himself God” (Paul VI, 7th Dec
1965) which then caused untold
damage to souls.

At the level of the faithful, in the
late 60s, catechisms started to ap-

pear that departed grievously from
Catholic doctrine (e.g. the Dutch
catechism) or simply failed to teach
basic doctrine. How many “Cath-
olic” youth today know their basic
catechism? One ought not to be
surprised that so many youth
leave a faith which they had
never been properly taught. I re-
member the priest in my year 8 in
1969 who took our catechism group
in his office and simply said: "what
do you want to talk about?" I
stopped going… My father, who
was teacher in a Catholic school,
was part of a group of parents who
had organised to teach catechism
themselves, to make sure their chil-
dren would know their basic cat-
echism. He did not have “canonical
mission” from his bishop, but he
was exercising his duty as a Cath-
olic father (God blessed him with
three priests out of his five
children).

At the same time, the situation in
seminaries was appalling: the mod-
ernists had the wind in their sails
and knew no limit. Those who
wanted to uphold orthodoxy were
put aside, and often left these sem-
inaries, which, in any case, would
soon close for want of vocations!

Meanwhile, when so many were
destroying, Archbishop Lefebvre



was edifying. In 1969, he opened a
house of study at Fribourg under
Bishop Charrière; in 1970 he
opened Ecône as a “house of spir-
ituality” with the approval of
Bishop Adam of Sion, Wallis
(Switzerland), and the next year he
obtained the approval of the same
bishop for Ecône to become a fully-
fledged seminary. When he first
asked Bishop Adam in 1970 for his
approval, Bishop Adam answered:
“we still have three seminaries in
our diocese, so I do not approve
Ecône as a seminary; but as we
don’t have any ‘houses of spiritual-
ity’ which are a little different, I ap-
prove Ecône as a ‘house of
spirituality’.”

But given the degradation of the
situation in the Catholic university
of Fribourg in 1970 (the New Mass
had just been introduced), with a
mixture of good and bad teachers,
Archbishop Lefebvre decided to
choose only the good ones and
bring them to Ecône and thus again
asked Bishop Adam to allow Ecône
to become a fully-fledged seminary.
Bishop Adam answered: “Last year,
I didn’t give permission for a semin-
ary because we still had three sem-
inaries in the diocese. Two closed
last year. So, this year I give my per-
mission for Ecône to be a fully-
fledged seminary.” I hold this fact

from Canon Berthod, the rector of
the seminary in the early 1970s,
who knew all those concerned very
well.

This little event was quite signific-
ant: the introduction of novelties
led to decay; but fidelity to Tradi-
tion led to life and growth. One can
see this pattern repeated time and
time again in many places through-
out the world over the past fifty
years.

Was the SSPX good because it
was approved, or was it rather
approved because it was good?
The proper Thomist answer is that
the first and essential goodness of
an act comes from its object; ex-
ternal approval adds a certain ex-
trinsic goodness but does not con-
stitute the first and essential
goodness.

On the opposite side, the modernist
teachings in many seminaries re-
main objectively evil (destroying
the faith of many) even if the teach-
ers are “approved” with a canonical
mission from above! A canonical
mission does not and cannot make
Catholic a teaching which is op-
posed to the faith of all times.
It is important to note that the initi-
ative did not come from Archbishop
Lefebvre. Prominent Catholics

The Society’s early years



(clergy and laymen) urged him to
do something for the seminarians;
later it was the seminarians who
urged him to establish a bond
among them to keep the good spirit
he was giving them. Then he asked
for the canonical approval – and at
the beginning, obtained it – so that
all things be done in order.

Archbishop Lefebvre, as a true man
of the Church, always gave great
importance to this official recogni-
tion of the Society of Saint Pius X
by the Church, through Bishop
Charrière. His expression was:
“nous sommes d’Eglise – we are of
the Church”, as sons of the Church,
members of the Church, a living
branch solidly grafted on the tree of
the Church. It is because he always
considered the suppression of the
SSPX as invalid that he continued
the work. He would not have con-
tinued if he had considered the sup-
pression valid. It had an appearance
of validity, but not in truth, not in
the sight of God.

3. A few considerations of
canon law on the approval
of the SSPX

The Statutes of the SSPX say, in
their very first article: “The Fratern-
ity is a priestly society of common
life without vows…” Some say that

the SSPX was a mere pious union.
Their objection comes from the let-
ter of Bishop Charrière which con-
tains this confusion, saying that the
Society is erected in the diocese as
a pious union. What is one to think?

In my opinion, the best treatment of
the matter is by Rev. Fr. Thomas
Glover (doctor in Canon Law). Here
are his core arguments:

1. by the nature of things, a pious
union binds its members for a
part of their activity, for some
kind of particular good work
(including prayers…); a society
of common life without vows
binds its members for their
whole life to help them tend
towards evangelical perfection,
though with a bond lower than a
vow.

2. Canon Law deals with pious
unions in the third part which
concerns the laity while the
canons concerning societies of
common life without vows are in
the second part which concerns
the religious: two very different
sections.

3. Bishop Charrière approved the
statutes which precisely state
that the Society of Saint Pius X is
a society of common life without
vow, thus approving that status.
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Now the reality of the society he
was approving, known by Bishop
Charrière, did not correspond to a
mere pia unio but rather to what
was properly defined in the Stat-
utes, i.e. a society of common life
without vows.

Moreover, if the Society had been a
mere pious union, the act of sup-
pression would not have demanded
the intervention of the Apostolic
See (except to hear an appeal).
Moreover again, if the Ordinary had
desired the advice of the Apostolic
See for the sake of certitude, the
Sacred Congregation for Religious
would not have been competent, be-
cause a pious union is not subject
to that department. By the very fact
Mgr. Mamie consulted the Sacred
Congregation for Religious, he im-
plicitly admitted that the SSPX was
a society of common life without
vows.

Another very important principle of
law: “favorabilia sunt amplianda
odiosa restrigenda – favourable
things should be interpreted
broadly, unfavourable things should
be interpreted in a strict manner.”
Why minimise the intention of
Bishop Charrière as if he intented
to give as little approval as pos-
sible? On the contrary, the prin-
ciples of Law oblige us to say that

he wanted to support the good
work as much as he could. Any
other attitude shows an ill will to-
wards Archbishop Lefebvre and his
Society, rather than the charity
which is the heart of the New Testa-
ment Law.

4. The illegal suppression
of the Society of Saint
Pius X : 1975

Archbishop Lefebvre started with 9
seminarians in 1969; five years later
he had about 90. The bishops of
France started to worry; they did
not want priests trained in the tradi-
tional way; they started a campaign
of calumnies, as if Ecône was a
"wildcat seminary" (“séminaire
sauvage”), and the Vatican ordered
a visitation, which took place in au-
tumn of 1974. The visitors said that
they were happy with what they
saw, but in their conversation with
some seminarians they had ex-
pressed doubts about the dogma of
the Resurrection of Our Lord and
other scandalous opinions. Hence
Archbishop Lefebvre published a
beautiful Declaration on 21st Nov
1974.

In February 1975, he was convoked
by a commission of three Cardinals
(Tabera, Wright and Garonne) for a

The Society’s early years
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“chat” about the visitation, but the
whole conversation turned around
the Declaration.

Then came the letter of Mgr. Mamie
dated 6th May 1975 by which he, of
his own authority, “withdraws the
acts and concessions of [his] prede-
cessor.” Canon Law says that he did
not have that authority: a bishop
does not have the power to sup-
press societies of common life
without vows: he can approve one,
but once approved only Rome can
suppress it.

A letter from the three Cardinals
dated on the very same day simply
declared that Bishop Mamie had the
right to do what he did which is ob-
jectively against the Canon Law.

Archbishop Lefebvre made an ap-
peal against the procedure on 5th
June. On 10th June Cardinal Staffa
rejected the appeal under the pre-
text that the Pope took the matter
in his hands. On the 14th June Arch-
bishop Lefebvre made a second ap-
peal, asking for the documents of
the case. He never received an an-
swer to that second appeal, Car-
dinal Villot having ordered Cardinal
Staffa not to answer.
Ever since, that second appeal is
pending – and according to Canon
Law, such an appeal is “suspensive”,

that is, the decision to suppress the
SSPX is suspended until the appeal
is answered. Thus in reality, there is
no suppression; only the appear-
ance of one.

But, given the appearance of sup-
pression, he was faced everywhere
with refusal of any support.

5. The dilemma of the
Good Samaritan

Faced with such opposition, Arch-
bishop Lefebvre could very well
have given up the fight, sent back
all the seminarians to their homes
and closed the whole work. He
would have kept the faith and the
Mass for himself. Let the seminari-
ans and the few priests who were
already helping him take care of
themselves! If there had been many
other bishops forming the young
men in their seminaries in fidelity
to Tradition, he would have been
happy to do so. But, in 1975, where
could he send these young men?

The charity of Christ was pressing
him. (2 Cor. 5:14): he was very
much aware of the pressing need of
many souls for good priests who
would keep the traditional Doctrine
and Liturgy. Like the Good Samar-
itan (Lk. 10:30-37), he saw these
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souls wounded by the crisis in the
Church, left half-dead on the side of
the road, the local priest and Levite
passed by and did not care; he was
a stranger: would he abandon them
to take care of themselves, or
would he provide the help they
were begging for? He cared!

In order to understand Archbishop
Lefebvre, it is essential to grasp the
model of the Good Samaritan: the
Fathers of the Church often said
that our Lord Himself was like this
Good Samaritan; His home is
heaven, and He came on earth as a
stranger. The Old Testament priests
and Levites did not care for
wounded mankind, but He did, and
provided the wine (symbol of His
Precious Blood) and the oil (symbol
of the gifts of the Holy Ghost) and
brought the wounded to the inn,
symbol of the Church.

The continuation of the Society of
St. Pius X from then on by Arch-
bishop Lefebvre was essentially
that answer of the charity of the
Good Samaritan, who would
provide for wounded souls, who
would pass on to others the gifts he
had received: not only his priest-
hood but later even his episcopacy,
and who would lead these souls not
to a new sect, but to the one Cath-
olic Church.

Some accuse him, saying that he did
not have local jurisdiction? I will re-
turn to that question, but such an
objection is akin to the priest and
the Levite turning back to stop and
accuse the Good Samaritan of being
a stranger with no rights in Judea.

6. The problem of the Mass
- 1976

At the time, the battle for the Mass
was raging. Bugnini had issued his
little “Notification on the obligatory
nature of the Roman Missal of Paul
VI” (28th Oct 1974) to all the epis-
copal conferences. It is in this noti-
fication (and in no other document)
that one finds a clear prohibition to
offer the Traditional Mass, except
for priests above 75 years and then
only in private with one server. That
note was never published in the
Acta Apostolicae Sedis. It has no
canonical value. How could a
simple secretary in one such little
note overturn the Bulla Quo
Primum of Pope St. Pius V who had
exercised the whole weight of his
supreme Apostolic authority to
guarantee all priests “in perpetuity”
the right to offer the Traditional
Mass?

But many bishops used this little
note to pursue priests who had kept

The Society’s early years
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the traditional Mass, expelling them
from their parishes, etc.. I remem-
ber Father Fox in Sydney, during
the sermon of his 50th anniversary
Mass, showing the front-page of the
Sydney Morning Herald of that
time with the headline “Latin Mass
forbidden”, and saying: “I kept that
Mass!” There were a good many
priests who kept it: in my diocese
there were five, in my grandfather’s
diocese, they were four, etc. There
were hundreds of such priests in
France and in many countries, but
proportionally they were only a
remnant, yet they had the courage
to provide that Mass for the faithful
who were asking for it. Pope Bene-
dict XVI in Summorum Pontificum
clearly said that the Traditional
Mass had never been forbidden,
thus vindicating these courageous
priests and faithful.

But at that time many souls felt ter-
ribly abandoned: the little ones
have asked for bread, and there
was none to break it unto them
(Lam. 4:4). My eyes have failed
with weeping, my bowels are
troubled: my liver is poured out
upon the earth, for the destruction
of the daughter of my people, when
the children, and the sucklings,
fainted away in the streets of the
city. They said to their mothers:
Where is corn and wine? when

they fainted away as the wounded
in the streets of the city: when they
breathed out their souls in the bos-
oms of their mothers (Lam 2:11-12).

Blessed are those priests who, like
the Good Samaritan, provided for
these wounded souls! For I was
hungry, and you gave me to eat; I
was thirsty, and you gave me to
drink… sick, and you visited me…
Amen I say to you, as long as you
did it to one of these my least
brethren, you did it to me (Mt 25:
35-40).

Archbishop Lefebvre told us at the
seminary: “I did not want to hear
Our Lord on Judgement Day telling
me: ‘you destroyed my Church with
the rest of them!’ If I had closed my
seminary, I would have contributed
to the destruction of the Church.”
Not that the Church can be des-
troyed, but many souls have been
lost by all these novelties.

So he continued, and in 1976 he had
13 priests to ordain. Then the pres-
sure on him intensified, he was
urged not to go through with the or-
dinations. Mgr. Benelli, substitute of
the Card. Secretary of State, wrote
to him on 25th June in the name of
the Pope, requiring fidelity “to the
conciliar church.” This expression
takes it origin from that letter:
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Archbishop Lefebvre said: “What is
that church? I know not a ‘conciliar
church’, I am Catholic! What was
the reality signified by this expres-
sion? Indubitably a new spirit, alien
to the Catholic spirit, like a virus in
the Mystical Body of Christ, that
was trying to impose all the novel-
ties of Vatican II on unsuspecting
Catholic faithful.”

He explained in the sermon of the
ordination ceremony on 29th June
1976:

If in all objectivity we seek the
true motive animating those who
ask us not to perform these
ordinations, … it is because we
are ordaining these priests that
they may say the Mass of all
time… It is clear, it is evident
that it is on the problem of the
Mass that the whole drama
between Ecône and Rome
depends… in fact, the very
insistence of those who were
sent from Rome to ask us to
change rite makes us wonder.
And we have the precise
conviction that this new rite of
Mass expresses a new faith, a
faith which is not ours, a faith
which is not the Catholic Faith.
This New Mass is a symbol, is an
expression, is an image of a new
faith, of a Modernist faith.

For if the most holy Church has
wished to guard throughout the
centuries this precious treasure
which She has given us of the
rite of Holy Mass which was
canonised by St. Pius V, it has
not been without purpose. It is
because this Mass contains our
whole faith, the whole Catholic
Faith: faith in the Most Holy
Trinity, faith in the Divinity of
Our Lord Jesus Christ, faith in
the Redemption of Our Lord
Jesus Christ, faith in the Blood of
Our Lord Jesus Christ which
flowed for the redemption of our
sins, faith in supernatural grace,
which comes to us from the Holy
Sacrifice of the Mass, which
comes to us from the Cross,
which comes to us through all
the Sacraments.

This is what we believe. This is
what we believe in celebrating
the Holy Sacrifice of the Mass of
all time. It is a lesson of faith and
at the same time a source of our
faith, indispensable for us in this
age when our faith is attacked
from all sides. We have need of
this true Mass, of this Mass of all
time, of this Sacrifice of Our
Lord Jesus Christ really to fill
our souls with the Holy Ghost
and with the strength of Our
Lord Jesus Christ.

The Society’s early years
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Now it is evident that the new
rite, if I may say so, supposes
another conception of the
Catholic religion – another
religion. It is no longer the priest
who offers the Holy Sacrifice of
the Mass, it is the assembly. Now
this is an entire program – an
entire program. Henceforth it is
the assembly also that
replaces authority in the
Church… Slowly but surely the
Protestant notion of the Mass is
being introduced into the Holy
Church.

7. The first sanctions

The media at that time made much
of the case of Archbishop Lefebvre.
It seems that they pushed for his
excommunication, but only a sus-
pension came on 22nd July 1976.
This itself refutes those who accuse
Archbishop Lefebvre of being schis-
matic from that time: if it were true,
the penalty given then would make
no sense.

About that penalty, Archbishop Le-
febvre said: “it deprives me of the
right inherent to all priests and
even more to all bishops to celeb-
rate Holy Mass, to confer the sacra-
ments and preach in consecrated
places, that is, I am forbidden to

celebrate the new mass, to confer
the new sacraments, to preach the
new doctrine!”

He did not abide by the penalty be-
cause it presupposed the suppres-
sion of the SSPX, which was invalid
for defect of form (see the two ap-
peals above). Moreover, he said,
there was a lack of basic natural
justice: there had been no tribunal,
no precise accusations, no right of
defence, it was hurting the good of
third parties, etc. But fundament-
ally, at the supernatural level, the
measures taken against the Society
of St. Pius X were motivated by his
attachment to the doctrinal and
liturgical Tradition of the Church
and the rejection of the novelties
that oppose them: so, in their very
foundation, these measures were
vitiated and thus void.

All the media coverage of the ordin-
ations of 1976 was providential:
many faithful and priests around
the world attached to the unchange-
able Catholic Faith were greatly en-
couraged by his example. Before,
the situation was very gloomy for
them: the Traditional Mass was said
by older priests who would die out
and then what? But after, they knew
there was a bishop training young
priests who would keep the Mass
for them! He gave them hope. I
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want to give here the testimony of
Clovis Areui, chief of a tribe of
Kanaks (les Gouaraoui) in the depth
of New Caledonia: he heard of
Archbishop Lefebvre in 1976 and
his reaction was: “what is wrong
with that bishop? He says the Tradi-
tional Mass; he must be a good
bishop!” Later, after a scandal in the
cathedral of Nouméa (around 1980)
he wrote to Ecône asking for a
Mass in reparation and ending his
letter: “you train priests who will
say the Traditional Mass, you are
our hope!” By then, Archbishop Le-
febvre was receiving vocations from
all over the world. I entered Ecône
in October 1976; there were 19 na-
tionalities! The seminary was full.

Thus, the fundamental reason why
Archbishop Lefebvre continued his
work, even when he was sup-
posedly condemned, was fidelity to
the Catholic Faith: not only to keep
Tradition for himself, but to help
many souls in the Church keep the
Faith! He wrote: “how could we, by
a servile and blind obedience, play
the game of those who want us to
collaborate in their work of de-
struction of the church? … There-
fore, we have taken the firm resolu-
tion to continue our work of
restoring the Catholic priesthood
no matter what, convinced that we
cannot render a greater service to

the Church, to the Pope, to the bish-
ops and to the faithful.”

8. True and false obedience

The three great theological virtues,
Faith, Hope and Charity, cannot
have an excess: one cannot adhere
too much to the revealed truth, nor
trust too much in God’s help, nor
love God too much. All the other
virtues are moral virtues and they
consist in the right measure
between a defect and an excess:
one can have an defect of fortitude
(weakness) or an excess if it (viol-
ence and temerity). This is particu-
larly true of the virtue of obedience:
the true virtue consists in the right
measure between the defect which
is disobedience, not to execute a le-
gitimate order, and the excess
which is servility, to comply with an
illegitimate order. Typical example
of servility: the soldiers who killed
the holy Innocents.

St. Thomas explicitly treats the
matter: “Whether subjects are
bound to obey their superiors in all
things?” He answers very clearly:
No! “It is written (Acts 5:29): We
ought to obey God rather than men.
Now sometimes the things com-
manded by a superior are against
God. Therefore, superiors are not to

The Society’s early years
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be obeyed in all things.” Then he
explains: “there are two reasons,
for which a subject may not be
bound to obey his superior in all
things. First on account of the com-
mand of a higher power. Second, a
subject is not bound to obey his su-
perior if the latter command him to
do something wherein he is not sub-
ject to him.”

Now in the Church all authority
comes from Christ for a purpose:
the power which the Lord hath
given me unto edification, and not
unto destruction (2 Cor 13:10), for
the perfecting of the saints, for the
work of the ministry, for the edify-
ing of the body of Christ (Eph
4:12). It is a theme that comes six-
teen times in St. Paul’s epistles.
Now, how this edification is brought
about is not up to the arbitrary
whims of each Pope: it is an edifica-
tion in faith (Eph 4:29) and in char-
ity (Eph 4:16). The effort to thor-
oughly destroy the Traditional Latin
Mass, as Bugnini was doing in his
note and as Traditionis Custodes is
now doing, is certainly not “unto
edification”, but rather “unto de-
struction”; hence it is opposed to
the very purpose of Church author-
ity as given by Christ, no matter
how high. It has therefore no bind-
ing force.

What we do in the Society of
St. Pius X is what every good priest
was not only permitted but required
to do for centuries and centuries. In
the very words of Pope Bene-
dict XVI, “what earlier generations
held as sacred, remains sacred and
great for us too, and it cannot be all
of a sudden entirely forbidden or
even considered harmful. It be-
hoves all of us to preserve the
riches which have developed in the
Church’s faith and prayer.” For a
priest to do that is not disobedi-
ence, not even if his bishop forbids
him because the bishop’s authority
has been given to him “not unto de-
struction”. For a bishop to provide
for the future of the Mass by form-
ing priests and ordaining them is
not disobedience, even if the Pope
forbids him (when there is no other
bishop doing it) because even Papal
authority has a purpose from
Christ, it is “not unto destruction
but unto edification.”

Archbishop Lefebvre often said: “no
one can command us to diminish
our Catholic Faith!” That would be
directly opposed to the very pur-
pose of Church authority. And the
Catholic Faith is not made up and
modifiable at whim by the theolo-
gians of the latest council, but
rather it comes from Christ and his
Apostles and has been transmitted
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to us throughout the centuries: it is
Catholic Tradition.

9. Possession / use of
authority

It belongs to the same virtue to
avoid the defect and to avoid the
excess. Hence Archbishop Lefeb-
vre’s resistance to the suppression
of the SSPX is also a true act of the
virtue of obedience.

Compliance to a particular order re-
sponds to the use of authority. If a
command is bad, such a command
is more an abuse of authority than a
proper use of it; authority itself re-
mains good. Hence resisting such
command can very well co-exist
with submission to authority itself,
i.e. the readiness of the will to obey
any legitimate order coming from
that authority.

There is a huge difference between
the one who follows his own will,
even when complying with a com-
mand (because it pleases him), and
the one who, out of obedience to
the higher authority and ultimately
to God, resists the abuse of author-
ity, while keeping the readiness to
obey any legitimate order. The first
one is not really obedient though he
complied; the second is really obed-

ient, though he did not comply. The
modernists complied with the
changes, not out of obedience but
because these changes were what
they wanted: they were not really
obedient. But Archbishop Lefebvre
who resisted these changes was
truly practicing the virtue of obedi-
ence which resists the abuse of au-
thority out of obedience to the
higher authority of God. As he said:
“the masterstroke of Satan was
to lead so many into disobedi-
ence to Tradition in the name of
obedience.”

10. What about required
communion with the
Church?

All Catholic theologians admit that
resisting a particular order of the
Pope (even a legitimate order) does
not break communion with the
Church. St. Thomas gives the very
precise definition of schism: “schis-
matics are those who refuse to sub-
mit to the Sovereign Pontiff, and to
hold communion with those mem-
bers of the Church who acknow-
ledge his supremacy.” Refusal to
submit means to refuse to acknow-
ledge the right of the Pope to com-
mand; Archbishop Lefebvre has
never refused that at all; he ques-
tioned practical commands (e.g. to

The Society’s early years
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close the seminary), but never the
right of the Pope to command; he
questioned the use of authority, not
the possession of authority, keeping
always that readiness of the will to
obey any legitimate order. Not only
under Pius XII, but even under Paul
VI and John Paul II, his ideal was
the “serve the Pope.” Thus, in his
1974 Declaration, he says:

That is why, without any spirit of
rebellion, bitterness or
resentment, we pursue our work
of forming priests, with the
timeless Magisterium as our
guide. We are persuaded that we
can render no greater service to
the Holy Catholic Church, to the
Sovereign Pontiff and to
posterity.

These are not words of a schis-
matic! What makes his situation
special is that, in the crisis of the
Church due to Vatican II and the
post-conciliar reforms, there is a
whole new direction pushed by the
Roman Curia and the Pope himself,
a direction opposed to Tradition, in
theology, in liturgy, in relation with
non-Catholic religions, in relations
with the world (rejection of the so-
cial kingship of Christ: it was Pope
Paul VI himself who had asked
countries such as Columbia to take
away the first article of their consti-

tution affirming them as Catholic
countries!). That new orientation is
very clear in the discourse of Pope
Paul VI at the end of the Council:

Secular humanism, revealing
itself in its horrible anti-clerical
reality has, in a certain sense,
defied the council. The religion
of the God who became man has
met the religion (for such it is) of
man who makes himself God.
And what happened? Was there a
clash, a battle, a condemnation?
There could have been, but there
was none… A feeling of
boundless sympathy has
permeated the whole of it. The
attention of our council has been
absorbed by the discovery of
human needs (and these needs
grow in proportion to the
greatness which the son of the
earth claims for himself). But we
call upon those who term
themselves modern humanists,
and who have renounced the
transcendent value of the highest
realities, to give the council
credit at least for one quality and
to recognise our own new type of
humanism: we, too, in fact, we
more than any others, have the
worship of man.”

If Paul VI really had the spirit of the
Good Samaritan, he would have
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cured, not worshipped modern
man; he would have cured him by
pouring the Blood of Christ (signi-
fied by the wine of the good Samar-
itan), the Blood of Christ’s Sacrifice
on man’s wounds and led him to the
Church by exhorting him to con-
vert, but he did not. There is not a
word about the Cross in that
discourse.

Hence, working to continue the Tra-
ditional work of the Church led
Archbishop Lefebvre to resist not
only a few individual abusive com-
mands, but this whole new direc-
tion. And he found himself in front
of a wall: his objections were
brushed away in the name of obedi-
ence – disregarding the novelties.
At the request of Cardinal
Ratzinger, he had presented Rome
with a set of Dubia. He received the
response in 1987, which was basic-
ally not a response at all: just one
argument: obedience. Archbishop
Lefebvre’s response was simple, re-
calling the dogmatic constitution of
Vatican I about the power of the
Pope: “For the Holy Ghost was
promised to the successors of Peter
not so that they might, by his revel-
ation, make known some new doc-
trine, but that, by his assistance,
they might religiously guard and
faithfully expound the revelation or
deposit of faith transmitted by the

apostles.” This assistance of the
Holy Ghost is not something “auto-
matic”, which would guarantee that
every single action of the Pope
would be a faithful exposition of
the deposit of faith; it requires co-
operation from the Pope. So, when
the Pope promotes novelties, it is
not the work of the Holy Ghost!
Even Pope John Paul II acknow-
ledges that there are novelties in
Vatican II!

Some simply do not see how new
Vatican II and the post-conciliar re-
forms are; some claim that these
novelties are “in continuity” and
promote a “hermeneutic of continu-
ity”. But the truth is that sometimes
there is a direct contradiction, but
most of the time it is a complete
change of direction: a turn “towards
Man”, everything has become
centred on man, as Pope Paul VI
himself said, and this is manifest in
the new liturgy.

The rejection of these novelties, out
of fidelity to Catholic Tradition, is
certainly not a break from the com-
munion of the Church! If there is a
break, it is on the part of those who
have changed direction, of those
who have introduced novelties that
do so much damage to souls in the
Mystical Body of Christ; division is
not the effect of fidelity, fidelity to
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the faith of all times, to the liturgy
of all times, to the examples of the
saints.

11 What is the Unity of the
Church?

Some tend to reduce communion
with the Church to obedience to the
Pope. This is certainly far from
Catholic doctrine.

St. Thomas speaks about the
Church in a single question of his
Summa, speaking of Christ as the
Head of the Church (IIIa qu.8 see
art. 3 ad 2m). He teaches that the
unity of the Church is unity with
Christ, the unity of the Mystical
Body of Christ, and that is by sanc-
tifying grace (faith, hope and char-
ity here below, and glory in
heaven). But another doctor of the
Church, St. Robert Bellarmine, in
his masterpiece on the Church,
defines the Church thus:

Our definition is: there is only
one Church, not two, and this
one and true Church is the
congregation of men bound
together by the profession of the
same Christian faith, and the
communion to the same
sacraments, under the
government of the legitimate
shepherds, and chiefly of the one

vicar of Christ on earth, the
Roman Pontiff. There are thus
three parts to this definition: the
profession of the true faith, the
sacramental communion and the
submission to the legitimate
shepherd, the Roman Pontiff.

Far from being opposed to one an-
other, these two Saints and Doctors
complete one another: there is an
interior unity and an exterior unity,
because man is composed of body
and soul. It is not the body that
unites the soul, but the soul that
unites the body; so, of these two
levels, the interior unity of the
Church is undoubtedly the more im-
portant and the cause of the other.
In this interior unity consists the
very life of the souls, Christ dwell-
ing by faith in your hearts; being
rooted and founded in charity
(Eph. 3:17), Christ liveth in me… I
live in the faith of the Son of God,
who loved me, and delivered him-
self for me (Gal. 2:20). As the Char-
ity for God overflows over our
neighbour, so the bond of unity
with Christ extends to all the mem-
bers of His mystical body.

One easily sees how the interior vir-
tue of faith leads to the profession
of faith: having the same spirit of
faith, as it is written: I believed,
for which cause I have spoken; we
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also believe, for which cause we
speak also: (2 Cor. 4:13).

The interior virtue of hope leads to
prayer (hence worship) and the re-
ception of the sacraments to obtain
the help to go to heaven: hence sac-
ramental communion.

The virtue of charity leads to obedi-
ence: If you love me, keep my com-
mandments (Jn. 14:15). He that
hath my commandments, and kee-
peth them; he it is that loveth me
(Jn. 14:21). Obedience to Christ
leads to obedience to those appoin-
ted by Christ to rule the people of
God. But that obedience is always
within the fidelity to Tradition, as
St. John writes: this is charity, that
we walk according to his com-
mandments. For this is the com-
mandment, that, as you have
heard from the beginning, you
should walk in the same: (2 Jn.
1:6). For you, let that which you
have heard from the beginning,
abide in you. If that abide in you,
which you have heard from the be-
ginning, you also shall abide in
the Son, and in the Father (1 Jn.
2:24).

It is important to note the primacy
of faith: it is the very first interior
bond and the profession of the one
true faith is the first of the exterior

bonds. The importance of the Pope
as centre of the unity of the Church
comes precisely from the fact that
our Lord Jesus Christ gave him the
duty to confirm his brethren in the
Faith. Faith cannot be put aside as
secondary.

Thus the triple interior bond corres-
ponds to the triple exterior bond, it
is the source and the soul of it.
Three interior plus three exterior,
that makes six elements in the unity
of the Church. Of these six ele-
ments, the most important, the one
without which there is no salvation
is charity. Though charity is im-
possible without faith, because the
supernatural love of God follows
the supernatural knowledge of God,
faith without charity is dead and in-
sufficient for salvation. External
union without charity is also worth
nothing (I Cor. 13:1-3). Charity is
the bond of perfection (Col. 3:14)

Now what happens if some element
is missing? It is a dogma of faith
(against the Donatists) that there is
a mixture of just and sinners within
the Church (militant, not tri-
umphant). Thus even charity can be
missing without (completely) cut-
ting the bond with the Church; the
bond is certainly wounded and im-
perfect but it still remains. It is also
the unanimous teaching of the
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Church that in the absence of the
baptism of water one can be saved
by the baptism of blood or desire,
which, despite not being sacra-
ments, nevertheless create a true
bond with the Church (the martyr
posses an act of supernatural char-
ity and a profession of faith; the
catechumen is also in charity, and
posses an act of obedience to the
Church in waiting for his baptism).

St. Robert Bellarmine himself gives
an example where the third ele-
ment, submission to the legitimate
shepherd, is missing:

It may happen that an
excommunicated man retains his
baptism, the profession of faith
and the subjection to the
legitimate prelates, and thus be a
friend of God, if his
excommunication was unjust; it
may also happen that a man
justly excommunicated does
penance, and has the above three
[baptism, profession of faith, and
obedience] before he receives
the absolution, and thus he
would be in the Church, even
while remaining still
excommunicated. I answer that
such a man is in the Church by
his soul, i.e. by desire, which is
sufficient for him unto salvation,
but he is not yet by his body, i.e.

by external communion, which
makes one properly speaking
member of the visible Church on
earth.

Indeed, one ought to consider two
aspects of the “submission to the le-
gitimate shepherd”: there is the re-
cognition of the superior by the in-
ferior and the recognition of the
inferior by the superior. The first
one is absolutely required; indeed
the refusal to recognise the Pope as
the highest superior is precisely the
sin of schism as St. Thomas ex-
plains; but the second is sometimes
missing by the fault of the superior
rather than of the inferior: the typ-
ical example was the excommunica-
tion of St Joan of Arc by Bishop
Cauchon! Visibly, she was out; but
in reality she was very much united
with the Church, Mystical Body of
Christ!

St. Augustine, in his De vera reli-
gione 6.11, writes:

Sometimes, too, divine
providence will allow even good
men to be expelled from the
Christian community through
some outbreak of turbulence and
discord on the part of fleshly-
minded folk. When they show
inexhaustible patience in putting
up with such an insult or injury
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for the sake of the peace of the
Church and do not undertake any
novelties in the way of schism or
heresy, they will teach us all with
what heartfelt loyalty and
genuine charity we should serve
God. The intention therefore of
such men is certainly to find
their way back once the tornado
has subsided. But if this is not
permitted them—because the
same hurricane persists, or an
even more savage one would
start if they came back—they
will continue willingly to
consider the interests even of
those to whose agitations and
trouble-making they have given
way, without ever setting up their
own separate conventicles, and
to defend and assist with their
testimony the same faith that
they know is being proclaimed in
the Catholic Church. The Father
who sees in secret (Mt 6:4) will
in secret award these men their
crown. This kind is rarely to be
seen, but, all the same, instances
of them are not lacking; indeed
there are more of them than you
could imagine. Thus it is that
divine providence makes use of
all kinds of men and women and
their examples for healing souls
and establishing a spiritual
people.

If they are “crowned by the Father”,
it is because they are in the Mys-
tical Body of Christ (otherwise, one
would deny extra Ecclesiam nulla
salus): they have the inner bond,
and the exterior bonds except half
of the third: they are (unjustly)
denied recognition by their
superior.

As for the Society of St. Pius X, it is
clear that we have at least the first
five and the submission of the in-
ferior to the superior; as for the re-
cognition of the inferior by the su-
perior, there has not been any clear
declaration for the whole SSPX; the
1988 penalty, if it were valid, ap-
plies at most for the two consecrat-
ing and four consecrated bishops
since odibilia sunt restringenda –
unfavourable elements should be
interpreted in a strict manner, not
extended to everyone! I say, if it
were valid, because Canon Law it-
self says that in case of necessity, at
least subjective, there is no auto-
matic penalty; since John Paul II
did not inflict a special penalty but
simply said that the Canon Law ap-
plies, then applying the Canon Law
there is no penalty!

Conclusion: the Society of St. Pius
X is within the Catholic Church.
That which is missing for us is a
regular canonical situation, but that
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lack is not our fault (we certainly
never wanted the original apparent
suppression of the SSPX): we want
that situation to be corrected,
but not at the expense of Faith.
That lack of a regular canonical
situation does not put us outside
the Church, because it does not im-
ply any refusal of recognition. Law
sets order: and order is good. The
mission of the Church ought to be
orderly and thus it is governed by
Canon Law. There is disorder today
due to the tempest of modernism,
but it does not break the bond of
the SSPX with the Church.

11. Further objection: what
about the required
“canonical mission”?

We all acknowledge that at every
level of the clergy there is need of a
canonical mission, so that the work
of the Church may be done in an or-
derly way. But there are different
kinds of such mission.

There is a mission “ab homine –
from the man”, given for example
by the bishop to assistant priests
for the hearing of confession and
some particular priestly work.

There is a mission “ab officio –
from the office”: for instance the

appointment of a priest as parish
priest includes all the duties of the
parish priest and the powers re-
quired for them. This is the typical
mission of a diocesan bishop: by
nominating a bishop in a certain
diocese, the Pope gives him the
mission to care for the sheep of that
diocese, with all the powers that go
with it. Though the Pope has the
right to restrict certain of these
powers (e.g. reserved sins), the
very nature of the office and duties
of a diocesan bishop is not of the
Pope’s making, but rather it is our
Lord who has establish these duties
(the responsibility to teach the
Faith in its integrity, to provide the
worship and Sacraments in fidelity
to Tradition, etc.). The Pope does
not have the right to change the
constitution of the Church.

But there are also cases of what can
be called a mission “a iure – by
the Law”. Canon Law explicitly
foresees certain cases in which a
priest without normal jurisdiction/
mission is faced with some neces-
sity of the faithful, and Canon Law
gives him a mission, since the salva-
tion of souls is the supreme law.
How can that be? Is it (i) that juris-
diction is not needed in these
cases? Or is it (ii) that the Law it-
self gives jurisdiction, or is it (iii)
that the Pope in approving the
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Canon Law gives jurisdiction, or is
it (iv) that Christ bypasses all inter-
mediaries and gives jurisdiction
Himself? Canon Law itself does not
settle the question as to how this
happens, but undoubtedly does say
that jurisdiction is given – which
implies a certain canonical mission
“ad casum – for that particular
case.” It also clear that this jurisdic-
tion/mission is given without a per-
sonal act of the Pope: which refutes
the claim of those who say that the
explicit will of the Pope is required
by divine law for a canonical
mission.

Of the explanation, it seems that
the best is the third, viz. that by ap-
proving the Canon Law and by the
very will to be Pope, and thus to
fulfil the duties of such elevated
state, the Pope does give that ca-
nonical mission and jurisdiction for
such cases. He needs not know of
each case; he may even not agree
with a particular case, but since his
duty to care for the good of the
flock of Christ binds him to provide
what is needed for the salvation of
souls, it may be reckoned that he
desires to grant that canonical mis-
sion. For instance, it has been docu-
mented that Cardinal Wojtyla or-
dained some Czech priests in spite
of the agreement between Card.
Casaroli and the communist Czech

government: in such case, even if
Pope Paul VI would have disap-
proved of these ordinations, he ac-
ted for the good of souls, with such
canonical mission a iure. Though it
is not in the letter of the law: it
flows from the principles of the
Law.

Indeed, St. Thomas Aquinas ex-
plains that the virtue of prudence
includes eight “integral parts”; one
of the is “intellectus – intelligence”,
that is, the understanding of the
proper principles that are necessary
to guide properly the action. At the
seminary, I remember Archbishop
Lefebvre explaining these prin-
ciples: from the letter of the Canon
Law, he drew the principles guiding
the law of the Church, and above all
that salus animarum – the salva-
tion of souls is the supreme law.

Some object: your situation is not in
the letter of the law. But the current
situation of the Church with all the
novelties and novel orientation of
the Council and post-conciliar re-
forms is also a new situation: one
needs to consider the principles of
the law in order to remain faithful
to the spirit of the Church: the letter
killeth, the spirit quickeneth. (2
Cor 3:6) The spirit of the Church is
certainly the model of the Good
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Samaritan, for the life of the
wounded souls.

Additional note: that there can ex-
ist a canonical mission / jurisdiction
outside the normal letter of the
Canon Law can easily be proven by
the very fact that Pope Francis has
given the Society jurisdiction for
confession: in a manner that does
not fit any regular canon!

12. What about the
marriage tribunal?

The SSPX does not have an ecclesi-
astical tribunal (except when the
Pope has delegated a case to be
dealt with by us). A marriage
tribunal is not exactly a normal
tribunal: in a tribunal, the judge has
the power to impose penalties and
other duties on the parties; to have
such right, there is need to have
regular authority over the parties.
But a marriage tribunal simply
judges of a matter of objective
truth, without imposing any penalty
or new duties: it judges whether a
particular ceremony of marriage
was a valid marriage or not. Here,
authority does not affect the truth
of the judgement, but only who has
the responsibility to give such
judgement.

What occurred to bring about the
SSPX marriage tribunal was the
great increase in the number of an-
nulments of marriages after the
Council. It came to the point that
some referred to the decrees of an-
nulments as “catholic divorce”.
How did this happen? Many of these
annulments were granted “for lack
of due discretion”.

Can. 1095, 2º of the Code of Canon
Law states: “They are incapable of
contracting marriage, who suffer
from grave lack of discretion of
judgment concerning essential mat-
rimonial rights and duties which are
to be mutually given and accepted.”
But a wide application of this vague
“grave lack of discretion” meant
that, where the marriage was im-
prudent, it was often judged as in-
valid. Some judges practically re-
quired a degree of maturity before
the marriage that is scarcely
achieved after years of marriage by
normal couples! In consequence,
many faithful became confused:
some whose marriage ended up in a
divorce were told: just get an annul-
ment! But their conscience ques-
tioned this: they remembered that
when they got married, they really
did what was needed precisely be-
cause they wanted to get married.
Some who found tradition after
their marriages were annulled,
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wondered whether their second
marriages were valid; their con-
sciences were not so clear when
they received their annulments.

Now, in order to make the sacrifices
that difficult situations demand,
such as when one has been aban-
doned by one’s legitimate spouse,
there is need of solid certitude;
doubts and hesitation tend to break
the courage to make these sacri-
fices. Many faithful found they
could not trust the local clergy on
the matter of these annulments, and
they came to us, asking us: was my
marriage valid? Was my annulment
valid? Is my second marriage valid?
Such questions are just questions of
facts: a priest can give his own per-
sonal opinion on the matter, but
such opinion does not carry much
weight and would not be sufficient
to establish the certitude required
either to have true peace of con-
science or to make the sacrifice re-
quired if one has to remain alone.
Indeed, one could always search for
a compliant priest… it is always
possible to find one – but then the
conscience would not be at peace.

In normal circumstances, this is the
very purpose of the marriage
tribunal: the diligence that the
bishop ought to take to choose the
judges and to make sure his

tribunal follows the proper precau-
tions of law provide the guarantee
that the judgement is reliable. But,
as explained before, the new atti-
tude of many judges after the Coun-
cil rendered such marriage courts
no longer reliable.

To provide for the need of the faith-
ful deeply affected by the unreliab-
ility of many marriage tribunals is
not to claim any authority over
them, but rather – like the Good
Samaritan – to care for wounded
souls. By providing them with the
careful choice of good judges and
the usual process traditionally re-
quired by the Church, we can offer
them a reliable judgement with
which they can find peace of con-
science and sometimes the courage
to live a life of sacrifice (e.g. when
abandoned by their spouse).

13. Some accuse
Archbishop Lefebvre of
heresy.

This accusation is so unbelievable
that I left it to the end. The reason-
ing is that, by refusing the Profes-
sion of faith decreed in 1989, Arch-
bishop Lefebvre and the SSPX make
themselves heretics.
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Those who make this accusation
seem not to be aware that there is a
deep crisis of faith, where every
dogma is being reinterpreted and
often thereby completely emptied
of its meaning by great numbers of
modern theologians. For instance,
the dogma of original sin is a fre-
quent target of their reinterpreta-
tion: indeed, since they believe in
evolution, they do not believe that
there was a first man Adam and a
first woman Eve; by what circum-
volution they reinterpret the ori-
ginal sin, I let you imagine. Need-
less to say, it has very little to do
with what St. Paul taught and all
Catholic Tradition after him: as by
one man sin entered into this
world, and by sin death; and so
death passed upon all men, in
whom all have sinned (Rom. 5:12).
Given this crisis of faith, which is
partly due to the novelties found
within Vatican II itself and the new
orientation it has taken, the danger
of the new profession of faith is in
its last paragraph. We have evid-
ently no problem with the Creed
and with the first two subsequent
paragraphs that deal with the defin-
ite teachings of the ex-cathedra ma-
gisterium and of the ordinary and
universal magisterium. But this
third paragraph puts together under
“authentic” magisterium non-defin-
itive doctrines of the universal or-

dinary magisterium which we ac-
cept and novelties of Vatican II and
post-conciliar bishops which we
cannot accept. It completely fails to
put the criteria that should govern
such teachings, viz. its conformity
with Tradition.

Definitive magisterium of the
Church requires absolute assent;
non-definitive magisterium does not
require absolute assent; the reli-
gious assent it requires being not
absolute, it does not remove the
possibility that, when the doctrine
taught is new and in opposition
with constant past doctrine, then
consent must be withheld.

This new profession of faith basic-
ally disregards the fact of the novel-
ties of Vatican II, and wants every-
one to swallow them as if they were
perfectly Catholic.

It is out of true fidelity to the un-
changeable Catholic Faith that we
reject the imprecision of this third
paragraph.

14. One last point: are
miracles required to justify
Archbishop Lefebvre’s
action?
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The objection goes thus: “for a min-
ister to prove he has an extraordin-
ary mission, the Church has always
required him to have miracles.” This
is true for example for Lourdes or
Fatima: Bernadette and the Three
Children claimed to have a vision
and a message; the Church authorit-
ies rightly asked for miracles,
which did come in both cases, thus
authenticating both the vision and
the message.

But it is not a universal principle.
For instance, when St. Joan of Arc,
who certainly had an extraordinary
mission, went to the dauphin to ask
for an army for Orleans, he had her
examined by the doctors in theo-
logy of the university of Poitiers,
who found her sound in her faith
and morals. When they asked: if
God wants to give you a victory, He
does not need soldiers, she simply
answered: “the soldiers shall fight
and God shall give the victory.” The
victory of Orleans, which changed
the course of history, was not a mir-
acle, God did not bypass the usual
secondary causes but rather moved
them to the desired effect.

But the case of Archbishop Lefeb-
vre is quite different: he had no ex-
traordinary mission. At the semin-
ary, he explained to us why he did
not fall for visionaries who were

contacting him either for or against.
He explained: “our faith is based on
the testimony of God, Our Lord Je-
sus Christ, and His teaching reaches
us by being faithfully handled down
through Catholic Tradition. It is a
wrong conception of the faith to
pretend that we need a direct link
with God: this would bypass the
Church and thus be opposed to
what Our Lord has established. It is
in the Church, through that faithful
transmission through the centuries,
that we receive the gifts of Our
Lord Jesus Christ, doctrine and
Sacraments.”

Thus, since his providential mission
was precisely a mission of fidelity
to Tradition, it was fitting that he
did not bypass it by miracles (it
would have been too easy for us…).

The Society’s early years

Archbishop Lefebvre

arrives in Dakar, 1947
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March

ARCHBISHOP MARCEL LEFEBVRE, Father Jeremiah Donovan, Father Augustine Cummins,

C.S.S.R, Father Guy Bouvier, Father Geoff Hilton, Cyril Empson, E.Watkins, Mrs. P. Fooks, Helen

Guy, Robert Malcolm, Roy Hawkins, Bernard Kenworthy-Browne, Hannah Prior, Mrs. O’Farrell,

Michel Flaherty, Joseph Pacholack, William Thomas, Henry Vaughan, Mrs W. Thomas, Dr.

Mather, Mary Osborne, Hubert Lewis, Mary Jones, Rosa Garrett, Colonel McSweeney, Bessie

I’Anson, Leonard Hurst, Maxwell McGrath, Mollie Redmond, Guy Stanhope-Pearce, Norah Firth,

Mary Kelleher, Florence Bradley, Lilian Baker,Veronica Salisbury, Leonard Costello, Betty Cullen,

Charles Allison, Thomas Leetch, Elizabeth Rowbury, James McMullen, Walter Hunt, Richard

FitzMullen, Andrew Martin, Constance Clarke, Teresa Brown, Bridget Sullivan, George Shea,

Francis Buckingham, Valerie Pollard, Veronica Brucciani, Maisie Woodward, Charles Tannant,

Hugh Forshaw,Cyril Begley,WilliamVinton,Agnes Callaghan,Valentina Libietis, JanetWheildon,

Bridget Duffy, Mary Mulligan, Teresa Welch, James Boyle, Thomas Parker, Joseph Drury, Eric

Morley, Evelyn Cundy, FrankWilkin, Ruth Carbery, Robert Wood, Carmen McAsey, Sister Moira,

Josephine Richardson, John Joseph Barry, Marcia Thompson, Margaret Pennicott, Peter D. E.

Budden,JamesO’Hare,Madeleine Primavesi, Dorothy Hardern,MartinMartinez Snr; Joan Sulli-

van,KathleenBryce,RoseBrannan,Edward Smith,DonaldHalliday,Diana Palmer, Louis Brophy,

Amey Davies, EdwardWiggins, Frederick Neesam, Catherine Connaughton, Edna Hartley, Mar-

garet Taylor, Jeanne Cuttell, Mary Agnes Adams, Vincent Baker, Francis Fernhead, Virginia

Nathan-Ciacci, Margaret Rowling, Monica Kemp, Francis Thomas Cooper, Francis Green,

Graeme Le Monier, Michael Osborne, Joan Evelyn Procter, Frank Critchley, Hilda Jackson, Truda

Kendrick,JohnOlna, IreneMcNicholas,Norah Dalgiesh,MarcMac Brádaigh,MarisaValori, Don-

ald Edwards,William Roberts, Josephine Barrell, Sheila Burger, Ruth McQuillan

X
Of your charity please pray for the souls of
Mrs. Margaret Parffrey of Defford who died on 7thFebruary 2023
Mr. Charles Kerr of Edinburgh who died on 9thFebruary 2023

Please also pray for the following whose anniversaries occur about this time.
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April

BISHOP ANTONIO DE CASTRO MAYER; Fr. Anthony Chadwick, Fr. Hugh Thwaites, Alma Keily,

Mrs.M.Gilbert,Teresa Kenefeck, Cyril Prescott,Margaret Tutt, Robert Carr, Jessie Nevard, Freda

Walton, John Silk, John Clitheroe, Gwen Hartley, John McKimmie,Agnes Kay, Katherine Husain,

Margaret Restieaux, Claude Couldery, Sudney Kay, Jane Ogden,Mary Judge,Mrs.M.McCarthy,

Elizabeth Boyle, Patrick Carpenter, Veronica McCauley, Ida McNello, Josephine Lawlor, Henry

Towers, Margaret Rennie, Gertrude M. Yates, Wilfred Dean, Kathleen Buckland, Norah Taylor,

Elizabeth Martin, Joseph Boyle, Basil Lewis, Nina Lynch, Mary Perry, Mary Keily, Maria Stigell,

Muriel Smith, Mary Carnoustie, Pamela Kenward, Cecilia Gill, Margaret Brierley, Lady Denham,

Catherine Skelton,Mary McDonald, Ellen Stew- art, Robert Hughes,Mervyn Goonesekera, Joan

Gac, John Lane, Esther McGlame, Geoffrey Nutter, Michael John Dowey, Dorothy Marshall,Wil-

liamGerrard-Crosby,Margaret Evans,PamelaMacdonald,AlanGreen,JamesBrennan,Kenneth

Collett, Bridgetta Johnson, Joseph Bryce, Albert Pollard, Barbara Mortimer,Werner Andersson,

Eileen Ladnor, Dorothy Mungovin, Lynn Clarke, Edward Hales, Kathleen Simmons, Hugh Bud-

den, Conception Traynor, Margaret Bradley, Francesco Vericonte,William Henry Riley, Margaret

Laurie,Mary PatriciaMackay,Theresa Ogden,Rachel Turnedge,GeraldineWeir, Kenneth Parkin-

son Mary Bristow, Byron Harries, John Clague, John Wood, Cyril Pettitt, Anne Patricia Dougal,

Cathleen Allen, Ursula Carr, John Cunnington, Louis Fisher, Jessica Vickers, Peter Baldwin, Ron-

aldWarwick, MariaWilliams, Anne Knott, Henry Fraser, Joan Harrison, Sheila Biggs, Pauline Ed-

wards, Catherine Taylor, Gerard Pearce, Winifred Middlehurst, Arthur Randell-Hoile, Patricia

Pass,Mary Radford, Robert McCaigue

Requiescant in pace
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Online Latin Courses

Mrs. Kelly Denham-Reid

All levels taught via Zoom.

Course outline

kelly_a_reid@yahoo.co.uk”

Handmade Rosaries

Christine Symonds

christinesymonds24@icloud.com

Etsy UK search “CHM Rosaries”

Retreats
Saint Saviour’s House, Bristol

2023

Mar 13-18 : Lenten Retreat (mixed)

Apr 1 : Lenten Day of Recollection

May 8-13 : Marian Retreat

Jul 3-8 : Women's Ignatian

Aug 7-12 : Men's Ignatian

Aug 25-27 : Youth Conference

Sep 11-16 : Women's Ignatian

Oct 9-14 : Men's Ignatian

Dec 16 : Advent Recollection

To book a place, visit fsspx.uk,

or email stsaviours@fsspx.uk,

or write to the above address

Te DeumPress

Find a growing range of

unique Catholic books

tedeumpress.com

Catechism Courses

Live
For catechumens and for those who

would like to learnmore about their faith.

The course is delivered by video confer-

ence on Mondays for beginners and

Thursdays for intermediates at 7:30pm

each week. Those interested, send a re-

quest by email to district@fsspx.uk

Recordings & Resouces
Visit our website

https://fsspx.uk/en/catechism-library

Cenacle Books
SSPX section

Aspecial section for SSPXbooks pub-

lished byAngelus Press and others.

Cheaper than ordering direct from

Angelus.

cenacle.co.uk/tradition-sspx

Notices
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Year Planner 2023

Mar 13-18 Lenten Retreat, St. Saviour's House, Bristol

31 Feast ofOur Lady ofCompassion (1 cl for the Society ofSt. Pius X)

Apr 1 Lenten Day ofRecollection, St. Saviour's House, Bristol

1 Sitientes. Ordination of seminarians to the Subdiaconate at Ecône & Dillwyn

6-19 St. Michael's School Easter Holidays

9 EASTER SUNDAY

10 All day adoration, St. Saviour's House, Bristol

23 Good Shepherd Sunday - for vocations

May 8-13 Marian Retreat, St. Saviour's House, Bristol

18 ASCENSIONDAY

27-29 Chartres Pilgrimage

28 PENTECOSTSUNDAY, Confirmations 10:00 Ss. Joseph & Padarn, London

29 Confirmations 15:00 St. Michael's School, Burghclere

Jun 3 Confirmations 11:00 Our Lady ofVictories, Preston

4 Confirmations 11:00 Ss. Margharet & Leonard, Edinburgh

8 CORPUS CHRISTI

12-19 YRC Rome trip

16 Priestly ordinations St. Thomas Aquinas Seminary, Dillwyn USA

27-4 St. Michael's School Half Term Break

29 Priestly ordinations St. Pius X Seminary, Ecône.

Jul 3-8 Women's Ignatian Retreat, St. Saviour's House, Bristol

3-8 Girls' Camp at Burghclere

8 St. Michael's School Summer Fair & End ofTerm

14-16 Cantebury Pilgrimage

24-29 Boys' Camp at Burghclere

Aug 7-12 Men's Ignatian Retreat, St. Saviour's House, Bristol

25-27 Young Roman Catholics Weekend, St. Saviour's House, Bristol

25-26-27 Walsingham Pilgrimage
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Sacred Triduum 2023

Maundy Thursday Good Friday Holy Saturday Easter Sunday

6th April 7th April 8th April 9th April

Bristol 1900 Mass 1300 Way of the Cross
1400 Confessions
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

2130 Confessions
2230 Easter Vigil

1000 Sung Mass

Burghclere 0830 Tenebrae
1900 Mass &
Adoration until
midnight

0830 Tenebrae
1400 Way of the Cross
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

0830 Tenebrae
2200 Easter Vigil

0730 LowMass
0900 Sung Mass

Edinburgh 1900 Mass &
Adoration until
midnight

1300 Confessions
1400 Way of the Cross
followed by Rosary
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

2130 Confessions
2230 Easter Vigil

1100 Sung Mass

Gateshead 1900 Mass &
Adoration for one hour

1300 Confessions
1400 Way of the Cross
followed by Rosary
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

1800 Confessions
1900 Easter Vigil

1100 Sung Mass

Glasgow 1900 Mass &
Adoration until
midnight

1300 Confessions
1400 Way of the Cross
followed by Rosary
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

2130 Confessions
2230 Easter Vigil

1100 Sung Mass

Leicester 1900 Mass &
Adoration for one hour

1300 Confessions
1400 Way of the Cross
followed by Rosary
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

2130 Confessions
2230 Easter Vigil

London

(St. Joseph)

1900 Mass &
Adoration until
midnight

1300 Confessions
1400 Way of the Cross
followed by Rosary
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

1830 Confessions
1900 Easter Vigil

1100 LowMass
1230 LowMass

Manchester 2000 Mass &
Adoration until
midnight

1300 Confessions
1400 Way of the Cross
followed by Rosary
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

2130 Confessions
2230 Easter Vigil

1100 Sung Mass

Preston 1900 Mass &
Adoration until 2200

1300 Confessions
1400 Way of the Cross
followed by Rosary
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

1800 Confessions
1900 Easter Vigil

0930 Sung Mass

Taunton 1800 Mass 1400 Way of the Cross
followed by Rosary
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

1100 Sung Mass

Woking 1930 Mass &
Adoration for one hour

1300 Confessions
1400 Way of the Cross
followed by Rosary
1500 Good Friday Liturgy

2130 Confessions
2200 Easter Vigil

1030 Sung Mass
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Mass Times

See fsspx.uk/en/schedules-great-britain-scandinavia for Jersey, Scandinavia , and latest updates

MARCH APRIL

5th 12th 19th 20th 25th 26th 2nd 9th 16th 23rd 30th

Aberdeen - -
22nd
1800

- - - - - - - -

Bingley 1500 1500 1500 - - 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500 1500

Bristol
0900
1100

0900
1100

0900
1100

0730
1100

1100
0900
1100

0900
1100

0000
1000

0900
1100

0900
1100

0900
1100

Burghclere
0730
0900

0730
0900

0730
0900

0715
1900

0715
1200

0730
0900

0730
0900

0000
0730
0900

0730
0900

0730
0900

0730
0900

Colleton Manor
8th
1130

- - - - -
5th
1130

- - - -

Edinburgh
0900
1100

0900
1100

0900
1100

1830 1100
0900
1100

1000
0000
1100

0900
1100

0900
1100

0900
1100

Gateshead 1800 1800 1800 1200 - 1800 1800 1100 1800 1800 1800

Glasgow
0830
1000

0830
1000

0830
1000

1830 1100
0830
1000

1000
0000
1000

0830
1000

0830
1000

0830
1000

Groombridge 0830 0830 0830 - - 0830 0830 0830 0830 0830 0830

Herne 1230 1230 1230 - - 1230 1230 1230 1230 1230 1230

Holnest 1600 1600 1600 - - 1600 1600 1600 1600 1600 1600

Inverness
21st
1900

- -

Jersey -
11th
1030

- - - - - -
15th
1030

- -

Leicester 1100 1100 1100 1900 1100 1100 1100 0000 1100 1100 1100

Liverpool 1300 1300 1300 - - 1300 1300 1300 1300 1300 1300

London

(Holloway)

1100
1230

1100
1230

1100
1230

1900 1100
1100
1230

1100
1230

1100
1100
1230

1100
1230

1100
1230

London

(Wimbledon)
0800 0800 0800 1100 0715 0800 0800 0800 0800 0800 0800

Manchester 0930 0930 0930 1230 1100 0930 0930
0000
1100

0930 0930 0930

Preston 0930 0930 0930 1100 1215 0930 0930 0930 0930 0930 0930

Rhos-on-Sea 1700 1700 1700 0900 - 1700 1700 1700 1700 1700 1700

Sheffield - - - - - 1700 - - - 1700 -

Stronsay 0900 0900 0900 1630 0800 0900 0900 0900 0900 0900 0900

Taunton 1100 1100 1100 - - 1100 1100 1100 1100 1100 1100

Woking 1030 1030 1030 1930 1030 1030 1030
0000
1030

1030 1030 1030
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DISTRICT HOUSE
Saint George’s House
125 Arthur Road
Wimbledon SW19 7DR
Tel: 0208 946 7916
district@fsspx.uk
Resident:
Rev. Fr. Robert Brucciani (District Superior)
Rev. Fr. François Laisney (District Bursar)
Rev. Fr. Matthew Clifton
Rev. Fr. Håkan Lindström

Scotland
ABERDEEN
Aberdeen Foyer Marywell Centre,
Marywell St, Aberdeen AB11 6JF
Tel: 01857 616206

CARLUKE
Saint Andrew’s House
31 Lanark Road
Carluke, Lanarkshire ML8 4HE
Tel: 01555 771523
standrews@fsspx.uk
Resident:
Rev. Fr. SebastianWall (Prior)
Rev. Fr. Francis Ockerse
Rev. Fr. Reid Hennick (District Secretary)

EDINBURGH
Saints Margaret and Leonard
110 Saint Leonard’s Street
Edinburgh EH8 9RD
Tel: 01555 771523

GLASGOW
Saint Andrew’s Church,
202 Renfrew Street, Glasgow G3 6TX
Tel: 01555 771523

INVERNESS
Royal Northern Infirmary Chapel
NessWalk, Inverness, IV3 5SF
Tel: 01857 616206

STRONSAY
St. Columba’s House,
Stronsay, KW17 2AS
Tel: 01857 616206
Resident:
Rev. Fr. Nicholas Mary CssR
Br. Gerard Mary CssR

England
BINGLEY
The Little House
Market Street, Bingley BD16 2HP
Tel: 01772 562 428

BRISTOL
Saint Saviour’s House
Saint Agnes Avenue, Knowle, Bristol BS4 2DU
stsaviours@fsspx.uk
Tel: 0117 977 5863
Resident:
Rev. Fr. John McLaughlin (Prior)
Rev. Francis Gallagher
Rev. Fr. Dominic O'Hart
Sr. Marie-Charbel JssR
Sr. Mary Joseph JssR

BURGHCLERE
Saint Michael’s School Chapel
Harts Lane, Burghclere, Hants RG20 9JW
Tel: 01635 278 137/173
headmaster@sanctusmichael.com
Resident:
Rev. Fr. John Brucciani (Headmaster)
Rev. Fr. Thomas O'Hart
Rev. Fr. Jonathon Steele
Br. Dominic Savio

CHULMLEIGH
Colleton Manor Chapel
Chulmleigh, Devon, EX18 7JS
Tel: 01769 580 240

GATESHEAD
Church of the Holy Name of Jesus
Gladstone TerraceWest, Bensham
Gateshead NE8 4DR
Tel: 07443 588 039

GROOMBRIDGE (TunbridgeWells)
Church of Saint Pius V,
Station Road, Groombridge TN3 9QX
Tel: 01892 654 372

HERNE
Saints John Fisher & Thomas More Church
Herne Street, Herne CT6 7HR
Tel: 0208 946 7916

HOLNEST
Private Chapel Tel: 01963 210 580

LEICESTER
Church of Saint Anne
Abingdon Road, Leicester LE2 1HA
Tel: 01858 555813

Mass Centres
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LIVERPOOL
The Church of Saints Peter and Paul
35 Upper Parliament Street, Liverpool L8 7LA
Tel: 01772 562428

LONDON
Church of Saints Joseph and Padarn
Salterton Road, N7 6BB
Tel: 020 8946 7916

MANCHESTER
Church of Saint Pius X,
16 Deer Park Road, Manchester M16 8FR
Tel: 01772 562 428

PRESTON
St. Mary's House
12 Ribblesdale Place, Preston PR1 3NA
Tel: 01772 562 428
stmarys@fsspx.uk
Resident:
Rev. Fr. Vianney Vandendaele (Prior)
Rev. Fr. AnthonyWingerden
Rev. Fr. Gary Holden
Br. Boniface

Our Lady of Victories Church
East Cliff,Winckley Sq, Preston PR1 3JH

SHEFFIELD
The Community Hall
St Mary the Virgin Church
402 Handsworth Road
Handsworth,Sheffield S13 9BZ
Tel: 0208 946 7916

TAUNTON
Church of Our Lady of Glastonbury
17 South Street (off East Reach), TA1 3AA
Tel: 01823 652701

WOKING
Church of the Holy Cross
Sandy Lane, Maybury, GU22 8BA
Tel: 01483 767 537

Wales
RHOS ON SEA
Saint David’s Chapel
Conwy Road, (A547) Mochdre LL28 5AA,
Tel: 01492 582586

Scandinavia
AALBORG, DENMARK
OSLO, NORWAY
MALMÖ, SWEDEN
GOTHENBURG
STOCKHOLM, SWEDEN

Rev. Fr. Håkan Lindström,
Tel: +44 20 8946 7916
h.lindstrom@fsspx.email
www.fsspx.uk/en/scandinavia
OSKARSHAMN
KALMAR

Rev. Fr. Sten Sandmark
(contact Rev. Fr. Lindström)

Jersey
Saint Nicholas Centre, Greve d'Azette
St. Clement, Jersey
Tel: +44 1534 857 186
_________________

Pious Groups

THIRD ORDER OF ST. PIUS X
Rev. Fr. Gary Holden
thirdorder@fsspx.uk

ARCHCONFRATERNITY OF ST. STEPHEN
Rev. Fr. Jonathon Steele
acss@fsspx.uk

EUCHARISTIC CRUSADE
Rev. Fr. Vianney Vandendaele
hostia@fsspx.uk

MILITIA IMMACULATAE
Rev. Fr. Robert Brucciani
Mr. Howard Toon
mi@fsspx.uk
militia-immaculatae.org

OL FATIMA CORRESPONDENCE
CATECHISM COURSE
Miss Monica Marshall
m.marshall@fsspx.uk

YOUNG ROMAN CATHOLICS
Rev. Dominic O’Hart
Mr. James Dew, Miss Tamara Martinez
yrc@fsspx.uk

EMERGENCYNUMBER: 0754 888 0281



The Society of St. Pius X is an international priestly society of common life without vows, whose purpose is the

priesthood and all that pertains to it. Since its foundation by Archbishop Marcel Lefebvre in 1970, the Society

has formed priests according to the immemorial teachings of the Catholic Church.

By teaching the traditional doctrine of the Church, by organising apostolates throughout the world, and by sanc-

tifying souls with the traditional Latin rite of Mass and the traditional sacraments, the Society’s priests continue

the apostolic work of two millenia for the glory of God and and the salvation of souls. Deo gratias.
fsspx.uk


